
 

 
DAB+ Transmitters Create Radio History   

 
A major milestone in the rollout of digital radio was achieved this week with the arrival in 
Sydney of the first DAB+ digital radio transmitters. 
 
Des DeCean, Chairman of the Commercial Radio Australia (CRA) Digital Technical 
Advisory Committee (DTAC) said, “This is a first for Australia and a truly significant 
milestone in the Australian DAB+ digital radio rollout.”   
 
Sixteen DAB+ digital radio transmitters are now in Australia and are being installed in 
transmitter halls at the various tower sites in the five state capital launch cities of Sydney, 
Melbourne, Adelaide, Brisbane and Perth in preparation for the Australian digital radio 
launch in May 2009. 
 
Other DAB+ infrastructure, including monitors and multiplexes, have arrived in Australia 
and the new antennas are under construction in Melbourne.  All the elements are currently 
being configured for the highly efficient new digital radio network. 
 
The CRA Digital Technical Advisory Committee (DTAC) has been meeting fortnightly for 
the past two years and it is fitting that this milestone was reached just prior to the final 
meeting for 2008.   
 
As a result of the innovative work of this Committee and a joint industry and government 
research grant, Australia will have one of the most spectrum efficient and sophisticated 
digital radio networks in the world.  
 
“This new digital infrastructure will allow Australians to listen to dynamic, multi-faceted 
digital radio and is an investment by the industry in the future of radio,” said CRA chief 
executive officer, Joan Warner.   
 
The DAB+ infrastructure will allow broadcasters to offer Australian listeners more stations, 
digital quality sound, a pause and rewind facility, plus a new informative visual aspect to 
radio with the introduction of scrolling news, sport and weather text and the ability to 
transmit a picture of a radio host, the cover of a CD, a product picture or an animated logo 
on screen. 
 
Following the installation of the transmitters, two rigging teams will start installing the DAB+ 
antennas onto a broadcast tower in each of the five launch cities.   The infrastructure build 
will continue throughout the summer in preparation for a five, state capital simultaneous 
launch to listeners in May 2009. 
 
For further information on digital radio visit:  www.digitalradioplus.com.au  
Media contact Melissa Fleming, CRA PR Manager Digital on – 0417 499 529. 
 

MEDIA RELEASE 
 

  

9 December 2008 

http://www.digitalradioplus.com.au/

